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Hariksha project funding release

Kameti Uma <kametiuma@yahoo.com> Thu, Oct 24, 2013 at 9:33 AM
Reply-To: Kameti Uma <kametiuma@yahoo.com>

To: Vivek Pai <vivekp@gmail.com>, Rama Subramanian <rsubramanian.2007@gmail.com>

Cc: Ravi Vipperla <v_ravi_kumar@yahoo.com>

Rama,
| agree with this idea.

Uma.

On Wednesday, October 23, 2013 11:11 PM, Vivek Pai <vivekp@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Rama,

| agree with this idea. Let me know how | can help move this along.
Vivek

On Wed, Oct 23, 2013 at 8:48 PM, Rama Subramanian <rsubramanian.2007 @gmail.com>
wrote:
Hi All,

Can you please respond to this?

Thanks
Rama

On Mon, Oct 14, 2013 at 9:51 PM, Rama Subramanian <rsubramanian.2007 @gmail.com>
wrote:
Hi All,

The next round of funding for the Hariksha project is due. | had setup a meeting last week
to discuss this, but due to limited attendance, | am doing this over the email.

| had donated $2000 last year to Asha Irvine for Hariksha project. This money was
released to Hariksha in the last round of funds that Asha sent them. The GE corporate
match for this $2000 was only recently processed since Asha central did not confirm the
receipt of funds on time. In addition, | had donated $5000 to Asha Irvine last month for this
project.
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| propose releasing $7000 to Hariksha. Please let me know if this is OK with you. | would
really appreciate your prompt response.

Also, going forward, Hariksha will be applying for funding from the SFO chapter. Uma is in
that email chain. Please let me know if you would like to be CC'd on that email chain.

Thank you very much,
Rama
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