From: Kinsuk Shah <kinsuks@gmail.com>
Date: November 30, 2017 at 12:20:14 PM EST
To: Gunjan khandelwal <khandelwalgunj@gmail.com>
Cc: Anjali B <anjali2009@gmail.com>, rahuldandu2002@gmail.com, Durgesh Gupta <durgesh100@gmail.com>, Vilasini Ganesan <vilasinig@gmail.com>, Neha Gupta <neha321@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Please VOTE today: Bodh Proposal for Funding
Approved from my end.

Best 

Kinsuk

On Nov 30, 2017 12:19, "Gunjan Khandelwal Shah" <khandelwalgunj@gmail.com> wrote:
Approved. 

Best,
Gunjan Shah 

On Nov 30, 2017 08:49, "Anjali B" <anjali2009@gmail.com> wrote:
Approved

Thanks,
Anjali

On Nov 30, 2017 8:30 AM, "Rahul Dandu" <rahuldandu2002@gmail.com> wrote:
Approved from my end
Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 30, 2017, at 5:52 AM, Neha Gupta <neha321@gmail.com> wrote:
All,

As shared on the chat group, we are looking to fund our 1st project this year (deadline is today, November 30th to submit the checklist) to re-activate the chapter and support a great cause. 

You have all previously had a chance to review the attached, but re-sending just in case. We will be looking to fund $10,000 out of the $15,969 that is available in the chapter funds. This way we retain powder for other projects and yet begin to make meaningful contributions from a disbursement perspective as a chapter.

Please reply with 'Approved' so we have an audit trail of each members vote. If you have any questions/would like to discuss, please call me at 201 492 4387. Apologies for the rushed re-confirmation but as we were just able to complete the site visit, the timeline is a bit tight.

Best,

Neha

On Mon, Jul 31, 2017 at 8:08 PM, Neha Gupta <neha321@gmail.com> wrote:


All,

For tonight's meeting and consideration. Of specific interest is the Asha application form. Thanks. 

Best,

Neha 
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From: Divya Singh [mailto:divvya.singh@gmail.com] 
Sent: Saturday, April 1, 2017 11:38 AM
To: aparnaabhyankar2003@yahoo.com
Cc: finace@bodh.org; Director Bodh Shiksha Samiti <director@bodh.org>; Durgesh Gupta <durgesh100@gmail.com>; Durgesh Gupta <Durgesh@gupta.us>
Subject: Proposal with budget
 
Dear Aparna 
 
 
Please find attached the draft proposal with the budget included in it. 
 
Here are some of the videos related our programme and some documents too
 
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=OPoZ663HlLk&t=40s
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=PlOmrBltsFI&t=15s
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=V9pRg_rsge0
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=-khkNAdqXYA&t=6s
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=hs8mWy94NsE&t=20s
 
 
Regards
Divya
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