
Gaurav Nanda <gaurav.07@gmail.com>

Conference Call with Purdue Chapter

Gaurav Nanda <gaurav.07@gmail.com> Sat, Jun 22, 2013 at 7:54 PM

To: WAH Asha <wah@ashanet.org>
Cc: Aarti Chigullapalli <aarti.chigs@gmail.com>, Seshasayee Venkataramani <sesha390@gmail.com>, Siddarth Chandrasekaran
<sc974@cornell.edu>, Ashok Panigrahi <Ashok.panigrahi@gmail.com>, Sindhu Rajaram <sindhu7789@gmail.com>, Pradeep J
<pradeepjraman@gmail.com>, gautam gauri <gautamgauri@gmail.com>, "Purdue (Treasury) Asha"
<purdue.treasurer@ashanet.org>, Asha Purdue <purdue@ashanet.org>, Asha Purdue Projects <purdue.projects@ashanet.org>,
Vinod Kumar <vvinodkumar27@gmail.com>, Prasoon Diwakar <pdiwakar@gmail.com>, Pujitha N <pujithan@gmail.com>, Sumanth
K <sumanthkilaru@gmail.com>, Rahul Batra <rahul.batra.in@gmail.com>, Suchismita Sarangi <suchi.nitr@gmail.com>,
asha-purdue-core@googlegroups.com

Thanks a lot for the update. We are excited to have Diksha included in WAH 2013.
We have initiated the process of sending the funds of about $2200 to Diksha, this way we will match the WAH budget. We will
update on this once the funds are sent.

We have prepared Diksha's video for WAH:
http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=_8KpAx72H7g&feature=share

Please let us know if you need access to the original video file.

We have also collected photographs and content for the website. We will be sharing it soon.
Based on last year's website, we are planning to finalize the writeup on these topics:

Donate: <Brief writeup of WAH budget and it proposed usage>
Project History and Mission
Project Goals and Challenges
Success Stories
Future Vision

Please let us know if we need to include any other topics/sections.

Regards,
Gaurav

On Wed, Jun 19, 2013 at 8:21 AM, WAH Asha <wah@ashanet.org> wrote:
Hello All:

Purdue submission is now part of WAH.

 As discussed, the current approved budget is $7406. Once he action items are completed, we can revise the budget. Please
try and arrange for those funds before July 15. 

WAH Team

On Wednesday, June 19, 2013, Aarti Chigullapalli wrote:
Thanks a lot for the updated evaluation checklist document and minutes. We will start working on the action items and get
back with you guys pretty soon.

Thanks,
Aarti

On Tue, Jun 18, 2013 at 10:54 PM, WAH Asha <wah@ashanet.org> wrote:
Hello All:
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Thanks for your time. 

PFA the updated evaluation checklist document and minutes. If any corrections, please let us know.

As discussed, please work on gathering the material for the website and on sending the needed budget to meet the WAH
target.

Thanks,

WAH Team

On Tue, Jun 18, 2013 at 9:38 PM, Seshasayee Venkataramani <sesha390@gmail.com> wrote:
Yes. I am using the same number. I am hearing to music. Let me  logout and login again 

Thanks,
Sesha

On Tue, Jun 18, 2013 at 9:37 PM, WAH Asha <wah@ashanet.org> wrote:
call has started...

hope you are using this:

Conference Dial-in Number: (424) 203-8400

Participant Access Code: 824982#

On Tue, Jun 18, 2013 at 9:35 PM, Seshasayee Venkataramani <sesha390@gmail.com> wrote:
All, 

I am in. Is anybody joining the call ?

Thanks,
Sesha

On Tue, Jun 18, 2013 at 2:07 AM, WAH Asha <wah@ashanet.org> wrote:
Reminder for project evaluation call tomorrow.

Time : 6:30 pm (PST) Tuesaday (June 18th)

Call details :

Conference Dial-in Number: (424) 203-8400

Participant Access Code: 824982#

Thanks

----------------------------

Gaurav Nanda

We have scheduled our conference call with you at 6:30 pm (PST) Tuesaday (June 18th).

Call details :
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